Project Name:
Owner:

South Side Storm Water

Phase 1V/Hampton Road Storm Sewer

Sanitary Reconstruction Project

Village of Whitefish Bay

Milwaukee County, Wisconsin

Bid Tabulation

Base Bid Cost Est.

Bid Date: February 13, 2014
Time: 10:00 A.M.
Project No. R11-0861-100

$2,894,675.00

CONTRACTOR

Vinton Construction Co.

Super Excavators

DF Tomasini, Inc.

Globe Contractors, Inc.

Reesman's Excavating & Grading

P.O. Box 1987 N59 W14601 Bobolink Ave. N70W25176 Indian Grass Ln. N50 W23076 Betker Road 28815 Bushnell Road
Manitowoc, WI. 54221-1987 Menomonee Falls, Wi 53217 Sussex, WI 53089 Pewaukee, WI 53072-0450 Burlington, Wi 53105
BID SECURITY 5% BB X 5% BB X 5% BB X 5% BB X 5% BB X
ADDENDUM NOs. 1 & 2 X X X X X
No. | Item [unit] oty Price | Total Price | Total Price | Total Price | Total Price | Total
Base Bid Items
Section A - Sanitary Sewer
1 |8" Sanitary Sewer Relay LF 199 $208.00 $41,392.00 $375.00 $74,625.00 $300.00 $59,700.00 $335.00 $66,665.00 $272.00 $54,128.00
2 |10" Sanitary Sewer Relay LF 693 $152.00 $105,336.00 $150.00 $103,950.00 $215.00 $148,995.00 $260.00 $180,180.00 $245.00 $169,785.00
3 |12" Sanitary Sewer Relay LF 345 $294.00 $101,430.00 $330.00 $113,850.00 $265.00 $91,425.00 $280.00 $96,600.00 $314.00 $108,330.00
4 [15" Sanitary Sewer Relay LF 1,314 $344.00 $452,016.00 $390.00 $512,460.00 $325.00 $427,050.00 $324.00 $425,736.00 $374.00 $491,436.00
5 [48" Sanitary Manhole (8 Units) VF 87 $480.00 $41,760.00 $250.00 $21,750.00 $300.00 $26,100.00 $350.00 $30,450.00 $761.00 $66,207.00
6 [6" Sanitary Sewer Lateral (pipe bursted) LF 3,090 $58.50 $180,765.00 $220.00 $679,800.00 $200.00 $618,000.00 $210.00 $648,900.00 $165.00 $509,850.00
7 _|6" Sanitary Sewer Lateral (open cut) LF 282 $120.00 $33,840.00 $135.00 $38,070.00 $175.00 $49,350.00 $250.00 $70,500.00 $178.00 $50,196.00
8 [6" Sanitary Sewer Lateral (R/W to house (pipe bursted) LF 240 $58.50 $14,040.00 $87.00 $20,880.00 $220.00 $52,800.00 $220.00 $52,800.00 $132.00 $31,680.00
9 |[6" Riser VF 75 $90.00 $6,750.00 $100.00 $7,500.00 $200.00 $15,000.00 $250.00 $18,750.00 $477.00 $35,775.00
10 |Concrete Encased Sanitary Sewer LATERAL EA 24 $350.00 $8,400.00 $700.00 $16,800.00 $2,350.00 $56,400.00 $600.00 $14,400.00 $3,805.00 $91,320.00
10a |15" Concrete Encased Sanitary Sewer EA 1 $400.00 $400.00 $2,300.00 $2,300.00 $3,225.00 $3,225.00 $800.00 $800.00 $4,940.00 $4,940.00
11 [12" Tideflex Check Valve EA 1 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $2,400.00 $2,400.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $4,100.00 $4,100.00 $6,215.00 $6,215.00
12 [Surcharge Level Indicator EA 1 $730.00 $730.00 $450.00 $450.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $1,900.00 $1,900.00 $902.00 $902.00
Subtotal - Section A, Items 1 thru 12, Inclusive... Subtotal| $989,859.00 Subtotal $1,594,835.00 Subtotal $1,552,245.00 Subtotal $1,611,781.00 Subtotal $1,620,764.00
Section B - Water Main
13 |8" Water Main Relay LF 340 $220.00 $74,800.00 $375.00 $127,500.00 $400.00 $136,000.00 $330.00 $112,200.00 $503.00 $171,020.00
14 |8" Gate Valve EA 10 $1,450.00 $14,500.00 $1,600.00 $16,000.00 $1,550.00 $15,500.00 $2,100.00 $21,000.00 $2,875.00 $28,750.00
15 |1-1/4" Temporary Water Service EA 23 $300.00 $6,900.00 $0.01 $0.23 | $1,800.00 $41,400.00 $400.00 $9,200.00 | $1,725.00 $39,675.00
16 |[1-1/4" Water Service LF 1,288 $72.00 $92,736.00 $85.00 $109,480.00 $130.00 $167,440.00 $190.00 $244,720.00 $85.00 $109,480.00
17 [1-1/4" Water Service Fittings EA 23 $535.00 $12,305.00 $500.00 $11,500.00 $400.00 $9,200.00 $500.00 $11,500.00 $758.00 $17,434.00
Subtotal - Section B, Items 13 thru 17, Inclusive... Subtotal| $201,241.00 Subtotal| $264,480.23 Subtotal| $369,540.00 Subtotal $398,620.00 Subtotal  $366,359.00
Section C - Storm Sewer
18 [Remove Storm Sewer Pipe LF 230 $26.00 $5,980.00 $35.00 $8,050.00 $95.00 $21,850.00 $150.00 $34,500.00 $67.00 $15,410.00
19 [12" Storm Sewer LF 585 $62.00 $36,270.00 $110.00 $64,350.00 $105.00 $61,425.00 $210.00 $122,850.00 $92.00 $53,820.00
20 [15" Storm Sewer LF 219 $70.00 $15,330.00 $80.00 $17,520.00 $135.00 $29,565.00 $212.00 $46,428.00 $105.00 $22,995.00
21 |18" Storm Sewer LF 286 $120.00 $34,320.00 $200.00 $57,200.00 $285.00 $81,510.00 $255.00 $72,930.00 $186.00 $53,196.00
22 |24" Storm Sewer LF 148 $100.00 $14,800.00 $165.00 $24,420.00 $225.00 $33,300.00 $260.00 $38,480.00 $211.00 $31,228.00
23 |30" Storm Sewer LF 25 $135.00 $3,375.00 $180.00 $4,500.00 $225.00 $5,625.00 $290.00 $7,250.00 $219.00 $5,475.00
24 |48" Storm Sewer LF 584 $185.00 $108,040.00 $310.00 $181,040.00 $290.00 $169,360.00 $370.00 $216,080.00 $344.00 $200,896.00
25 |54" Storm Sewer LF 656 $224.00 $146,944.00 $420.00 $275,520.00 $425.00 $278,800.00 $460.00 $301,760.00 $465.00 $305,040.00
26 |48" Tee Line Storm Manhole (1 unit) VF 18 $400.00 $7,200.00 $220.00 $3,960.00 $425.00 $7,650.00 | $1,700.00 $30,600.00 | $3,300.00 $59,400.00
27 _|48" Storm Manhole (2 units) VE 14 $560.00 $7,840.00 $335.00 $4,690.00 $440.00 $6,160.00 $400.00 $5,600.00 $565.00 $7,910.00
28 [60" Storm Manhole (1 unit) VF 7 $715.00 $5,005.00 $465.00 $3,255.00 $530.00 $3,710.00 $500.00 $3,500.00 $827.00 $5,789.00
29 |72" Storm Manhole (1 unit) VF 12 $564.00 $6,768.00 $430.00 $5,160.00 $975.00 $11,700.00 $600.00 $7,200.00 $1,615.00 $19,380.00
30_[96" Storm Manhole (5 units) VF 40 $890.00 $35,600.00 $940.00 $37,600.00 $975.00 $39,000.00 | $1,300.00 $52,000.00 | $2,146.00 $85,840.00
31 [108" Storm Manhole (2 units) VE 30 $880.00 $26,400.00 $900.00 $27,000.00 $1,010.00 $30,300.00 $1,800.00 $54,000.00 $3,040.00 $91,200.00
32 _|Catch Basin EA 33 $2,500.00 $82,500.00 | $1,850.00 $61,050.00 | $1,700.00 $56,100.00 | $1,800.00 $59,400.00 | $4,200.00 $138,600.00
33 _|Inlet Protection EA 35 $50.00 $1,750.00 $60.00 $2,100.00 $150.00 $5,250.00 $200.00 $7,000.00 $153.00 $5,355.00
34 |7" Concrete Handicap Ramp SF 605 $6.00 $3,630.00 $4.50 $2,722.50 $8.50 $5,142.50 $105.00 $63,525.00 $13.00 $7,865.00
35 |Detectable Warning Plates EA 10 $320.00 $3,200.00 $320.00 $3,200.00 $340.00 $3,400.00 $450.00 $4,500.00 $326.00 $3,260.00
Subtotal - Section C, Items 18 thru 35, Inclusive... Subtotal| $544,952.00 Subtotal| $783,337.50 Subtotal| $849,847.50 Subtotal $1,127,603.00 Subtotal| $1,112,659.00

Section D - Roadway Restoration
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Project Name: South Side Storm Water

Owner:

Phase 1V/Hampton Road Storm Sewer

Sanitary Reconstruction Project

Village of Whitefish Bay

Milwaukee County, Wisconsin

Bid Tabulation

Bid Date:
Time:

Project No.

Base Bid Cost Est.

February 13, 2014
10:00 A.M.

R11-0861-100
$2,894,675.00

CONTRACTOR Vinton Construction Co. Super Excavators DF Tomasini, Inc. Globe Contractors, Inc. Reesman's Excavating & Grading
P.O. Box 1987 N59 W14601 Bobolink Ave. N70W25176 Indian Grass Ln. N50 W23076 Betker Road 28815 Bushnell Road
Manitowoc, WI. 54221-1987 Menomonee Falls, Wi 53217 Sussex, WI 53089 Pewaukee, WI 53072-0450 Burlington, Wi 53105
BID SECURITY 5% BB X 5% BB X 5% BB X 5% BB X 5% BB X
ADDENDUM NOs. 1 & 2 X X X X X
No. Item Unit Oty Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total
36 _|30" Concrete Curb & Gutter LF 3,640 $14.50 $52,780.00 $18.00 $65,520.00 $18.50 $67,340.00 $18.00 $65,520.00 $23.00 $83,720.00
37 |[8" Concrete Pavement SY 5,485 $45.50 $249,567.50 $37.00 $202,945.00 $45.00 $246,825.00 $40.80 $223,788.00 $44.00 $241,340.00
38 |Base Aggregate Dense TONS 1,970 $21.00 $41,370.00 $14.00 $27,580.00 $25.00 $49,250.00 $16.80 $33,096.00 $35.00 $68,950.00
39 |4 1/2" Asphaltic Concrete Pavement TONS 70 $200.00 $14,000.00 $185.00 $12,950.00 $425.00 $29,750.00 $222.00 $15,540.00 $228.00 $15,960.00
40 |5" Concrete Sidewalk SF 4,710 $5.00 $23,550.00 $4.40 $20,724.00 $7.50 $35,325.00 $4.80 $22,608.00 $8.00 $37,680.00
41 |7" Concrete Driveway SY 55 $48.50 $2,667.50 $43.00 $2,365.00 $40.00 $2,200.00 $54.00 $2,970.00 $124.00 $6,820.00
42 |3" Asphaltic Surface Driveways TONS 2 $500.00 $1.000.00 $185.00 $370.00 $600.00 $1.200.00 $240.00 $480.00 $686.00 $1.372.00
43 |Sawcutting LE 6.675 $2.00 $13.350.00 $1.60 $10.680.00 $2.00 $13.350.00 $1.80 $12.015.00 $2.00 $13.350.00
44 |Re-sawcutting LF 2.300 $2.00 $4.600.00 $1.60 $3.680.00 $3.00 $6.900.00 $1.80 $4.140.00 $2.00 $4.600.00
45 |Tree Removal IN/DIA 500 $40.00 $20.000.00 $42.00 $21.000.00 $60.00 $30.000.00 $54.00 $27.000.00 $41.00 $20.500.00
46 |Trees EA 17 $260.00 $4.420.00 $425.00 $7.225.00 $500.00 $8.500.00 $600.00 $10.200.00 $400.00 $6.800.00
47 |Lawn Restoration SY 3.700 $7.44 $27.528.00 $18.00 $66.600.00 $8.00 $29.600.00 $6.00 $22.200.00 $14.00 $51.800.00
48 |lrrigation System (Manual) LS 1 $72.000.00 $72.000.00 | $80.000.00 $80.000.00 | $71.100.00 $71.100.00 | $60.000.00 $60.000.00 | $73.725.00 $73.725.00
49 |2" Schedule 40 PVC and Rewiring (estimated) EA 5 $1.921.00 $9.605.00 $1.925.00 $9.625.00 $2.200.00 $11.000.00 $2.400.00 $12.000.00 $1.960.00 $9.800.00
50 |Remove and Relocate Light Pole (estimated) EA 5 $1.100.00 $5.500.00 $955.00 $4.775.00 | $1.200.00 $6.000.00 | $1.200.00 $6.000.00 $965.00 $4.825.00
51 |6" Pavement Marking Crosswalk LF 2,080 $7.50 $15,600.00 $7.50 $15,600.00 $8.50 $17,680.00 $9.60 $19,968.00 $8.00 $16,640.00
52 |8" Pavement Marking Channelizing LF 45 $3.50 $157.50 $3.50 $157.50 $4.50 $202.50 $4.80 $216.00 $4.00 $180.00
53 |18" Pavement Marking, Stop Line LF 180 $10.15 $1,827.00 $10.15 $1,827.00 $1.75 $315.00 $13.20 $2,376.00 $11.00 $1,980.00
54 |Pavement Marking Arrows EA 1 $315.00 $315.00 $315.00 $315.00 $325.00 $325.00 $420.00 $420.00 $325.00 $325.00
55 |Traffic Control LS 1 $96,000.00 $96,000.00 | $11,400.00 $11,400.00 | $34,000.00 $34,000.00 | $45,600.00 $45,600.00 | $128,410.00 $128,410.00
56 |Detour Route LS 1 $9,115.00 $9,115.00 | $14,600.00 $14,600.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $1,530.00 $1,530.00
57 |Top Dressing Lawn Restoration SY 3,700 $1.47 $5,439.00 $2.90 $10,730.00 $2.00 $7,400.00 $1.80 $6,660.00 $3.00 $11,100.00
Subtotal - Section D, Items 36 thru 57, Inclusive... Subtotal| $670,391.50 Subtotal| $590,668.50 Subtotal| $669,762.50 Subtotal $598,797.00 Subtotal| $801,407.00
TOTAL - (BASE BID) - ITEMS 1 thru 57, INCLUSIVE... TOTAL | $2,406,443.50 TOTAL $3,233,321.23 TOTAL $3,441,395.00 TOTAL $3,736,801.00 TOTAL $3,901,189.00
Alternate Bid Items
No. Item Unit Oty Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total
487 Storm Sewer w/Low pressure head Sanitary Sewer
24A |Pipe LF 584 $185.00 $108,040.00 $348.00 $203,232.00 No Bid $413.00 $241,192.00 $380.00 $221,920.00
54" Storm Sewer w/Low pressure head Sanitary Sewer
25A |Pipe LF 656 $244.00 $160,064.00 $464.00 $304,384.00 No Bid $508.00 $333,248.00 $543.00 $356,208.00
48A |Irrigation System (Automatic) EA 1 $74,000.00 $74,000.00 | $82,600.00 $82,600.00 | $73,600.00 $73,600.00| $65,000.00 $65,000.00( $76,725.00 $76,725.00
Subtotal - Alternate Bid Items 24A, 25A and 48A, Inclusive... Subtotal| $342,104.00 Subtotal| $590,216.00 Subtotal $73,600.00 Subtotal $639,440.00 Subtotal| $654,853.00
TOTAL - Alternate Bid - ITEMS 1 thru 23, 24A-25A, 26 thru 47, 48A,
49 thru 57, INCLUSIVE... TOTAL | $2,421,563.50 TOTAL | $3,286,977.23 TOTAL | $3,443,895.00 TOTAL $3,798,401.00 TOTAL | $3,976,381.00
Alternate Bid #2 - Roadway Closure Option
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Project Name:
Owner:

South Side Storm Water

Phase 1V/Hampton Road Storm Sewer

Sanitary Reconstruction Project

Village of Whitefish Bay

Milwaukee County, Wisconsin

Bid Tabulation

Base Bid Cost Est.

Bid Date: February 13, 2014
Time: 10:00 A.M.
Project No. R11-0861-100

$2,894,675.00

CONTRACTOR Vinton Construction Co. Super Excavators DF Tomasini, Inc. Globe Contractors, Inc. Reesman's Excavating & Grading
P.O. Box 1987 N59 W14601 Bobolink Ave. N70W25176 Indian Grass Ln. N50 W23076 Betker Road 28815 Bushnell Road
Manitowoc, WI. 54221-1987 Menomonee Falls, WI 53217 Sussex, WI 53089 Pewaukee, WI 53072-0450 Burlington, W1 53105
BID SECURITY 5% BB X 5% BB X 5% BB X 5% BB X 5% BB X
ADDENDUM NOs. 1 & 2 X X X X X
No. | Item [unit] oty Price | Total Price | Total Price | Total Price | Total Price | Total
Section A - Sanitary Sewer
1 |[8" Sanitary Sewer Relay LF 199 $208.00 $41,392.00 $375.00 $74,625.00 $288.00 $57,312.00 $235.00 $46,765.00 $191.00 $38,009.00
2 |10" Sanitary Sewer Relay LF 693 $152.00 $105,336.00 $150.00 $103,950.00 $188.00 $130,284.00 $160.00 $110,880.00 $172.00 $119,196.00
3 |12" Sanitary Sewer Relay LF 345 $294.00 $101,430.00 $155.00 $53,475.00 $245.00 $84,525.00 $180.00 $62,100.00 $220.00 $75,900.00
4 [15" Sanitary Sewer Relay LF 1,314 $344.00 $452,016.00 $290.00 $381,060.00 $315.00 $413,910.00 $224.00 $294,336.00 $262.00 $344,268.00
5 [48" Sanitary Manhole (8 Units) VF 87 $480.00 $41,760.00 $250.00 $21,750.00 $252.00 $21,924.00 $250.00 $21,750.00 $532.00 $46,284.00
6 [6" Sanitary Sewer Lateral (pipe bursted) LF 3,090 $58.50 $180,765.00 $120.00 $370,800.00 $179.00 $553,110.00 $110.00 $339,900.00 $117.00 $361,530.00
7 __|6" Sanitary Sewer Lateral (open cut) LF 282 $120.00 $33,840.00 $135.00 $38,070.00 $153.00 $43,146.00 $150.00 $42,300.00 $124.00 $34,968.00
8 [6" Sanitary Sewer Lateral (R/W to house (pipe bursted) LF 240 $58.50 $14,040.00 $87.00 $20,880.00 $200.00 $48,000.00 $120.00 $28,800.00 $96.00 $23,040.00
9 |6" Riser VF 75 $90.00 $6,750.00 $100.00 $7,500.00 $200.00 $15,000.00 $150.00 $11,250.00 $333.00 $24,975.00
10 [Concrete Encased Sanitary Sewer LATERAL EA 24 $350.00 $8,400.00 $700.00 $16,800.00 $2,350.00 $56,400.00 $500.00 $12,000.00 $2,660.00 $63,840.00
10a |15" Concrete Encased Sanitary Sewer EA 1 $400.00 $400.00 $2,300.00 $2,300.00 $3,225.00 $3,225.00 $700.00 $700.00 $3,455.00 $3,455.00
11 [12" Tideflex Check Valve EA 1 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $2,400.00 $2,400.00 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,345.00 $4,345.00
12 |Surcharge Level Indicator EA 1 $730.00 $730.00 $450.00 $450.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,800.00 $1,800.00 $635.00 $635.00
Subtotal - Section A, Items 1 thru 12, Inclusive... Subtotal| $989,859.00 Subtotal| $1,094,060.00 Subtotal| $1,430,636.00 Subtotal $976,581.00 Subtotal $1,140,445.00
Section B - Water Main
13 |8" Water Main Relay LF 340 $220.00 $74,800.00 $375.00 $127,500.00 $389.00 $132,260.00 $230.00 $78,200.00 $351.00 $119,340.00
14 (8" Gate Valve EA 10 $1,450.00 $14,500.00 $1,600.00 $16,000.00 $1,550.00 $15,500.00 $2,000.00 $20,000.00 $2,010.00 $20,100.00
15 |1-1/4" Temporary Water Service EA 23 $300.00 $6,900.00 $0.01 $0.23 $1,475.00 $33,925.00 $300.00 $6,900.00 $1,205.00 $27,715.00
16 |[1-1/4" Water Service LF 1,288 $72.00 $92,736.00 $85.00 $109,480.00 $119.00 $153,272.00 $90.00 $115,920.00 $59.00 $75,992.00
17 |1-1/4" Water Service Fittings EA 23 $535.00 $12,305.00 $500.00 $11,500.00 $400.00 $9,200.00 $450.00 $10,350.00 $530.00 $12,190.00
Subtotal - Section B, Items 13 thru 17, Inclusive... Subtotal| $201,241.00 Subtotal| $264,480.23 Subtotal| $344,157.00 Subtotal $231,370.00 Subtotal $255,337.00
Section C - Storm Sewer
18 [Remove Storm Sewer Pipe LF 230 $26.00 $5,980.00 $35.00 $8,050.00 $75.00 $17,250.00 $50.00 $11,500.00 $47.00 $10,810.00
19 [12" Storm Sewer LF 585 $62.00 $36,270.00 $110.00 $64,350.00 $95.00 $55,575.00 $110.00 $64,350.00 $64.00 $37,440.00
20 |15" Storm Sewer LF 219 $70.00 $15,330.00 $80.00 $17,520.00 $125.00 $27,375.00 $112.00 $24,528.00 $73.00 $15,987.00
21 |18" Storm Sewer LF 286 $120.00 $34,320.00 $200.00 $57,200.00 $274.00 $78,364.00 $155.00 $44,330.00 $130.00 $37,180.00
22 [24" Storm Sewer LF 148 $100.00 $14,800.00 $165.00 $24,420.00 $215.00 $31,820.00 $160.00 $23,680.00 $148.00 $21,904.00
23 |30" Storm Sewer LF 25 $135.00 $3,375.00 $180.00 $4,500.00 $200.00 $5,000.00 $190.00 $4,750.00 $153.00 $3,825.00
24 |48" Storm Sewer LF 584 $185.00 $108,040.00 $310.00 $181,040.00 $276.00 $161,184.00 $270.00 $157,680.00 $240.00 $140,160.00
25 |54" Storm Sewer LF 656 $224.00 $146,944.00 $420.00 $275,520.00 $415.00 $272,240.00 $360.00 $236,160.00 $325.00 $213,200.00
26 (48" Tee Line Storm Manhole (1 unit) VF 18 $400.00 $7,200.00 $220.00 $3,960.00 $414.00 $7,452.00 $1,600.00 $28,800.00 $2,307.00 $41,526.00
27 _|48" Storm Manhole (2 units) VE 14 $560.00 $7,840.00 $335.00 $4,690.00 $436.00 $6,104.00 $300.00 $4,200.00 $395.00 $5,530.00
28 |60" Storm Manhole (1 unit) VF 7 $715.00 $5,005.00 $465.00 $3,255.00 $520.00 $3,640.00 $400.00 $2,800.00 $578.00 $4,046.00
29 |72" Storm Manhole (1 unit) VF 12 $564.00 $6,768.00 $430.00 $5,160.00 $466.00 $5,592.00 $500.00 $6,000.00 $1,127.00 $13,524.00
30 |96" Storm Manhole (5 units) VF 40 $890.00 $35,600.00 $940.00 $37,600.00 $967.00 $38,680.00 $1,200.00 $48,000.00 $1,500.00 $60,000.00
31 [108" Storm Manhole (2 units) VE 30 $880.00 $26,400.00 $900.00 $27,000.00 $998.00 $29,940.00 $1,700.00 $51,000.00 $2,124.00 $63,720.00
32 |Catch Basin EA 33 $2,500.00 $82,500.00 $1,850.00 $61,050.00 $1,620.00 $53,460.00 $1,700.00 $56,100.00 $2,937.00 $96,921.00
33 _|Inlet Protection EA 35 $50.00 $1,750.00 $60.00 $2,100.00 $125.00 $4,375.00 $100.00 $3,500.00 $151.00 $5,285.00
34 |7" Concrete Handicap Ramp SF 605 $6.00 $3,630.00 $4.50 $2,722.50 $6.50 $3,932.50 $5.00 $3,025.00 $10.00 $6,050.00
35 |Detectable Warning Plates EA 10 $320.00 $3,200.00 $320.00 $3,200.00 $320.00 $3,200.00 $350.00 $3,500.00 $322.00 $3,220.00
Subtotal - Section C, Items 18 thru 35, Inclusive... Subtotal| $544,952.00 Subtotal| $783,337.50 Subtotal| $805,183.50 Subtotal $773,903.00 Subtotal  $780,328.00
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Project Name: South Side Storm Water

Oowner: Phase 1V/Hampton Road Storm Sewer

Sanitary Reconstruction Project

Village of Whitefish Bay

Milwaukee County, Wisconsin

Bid Tabulation

Base Bid Cost Est.

Bid Date: February 13, 2014
Time: 10:00 A.M.
Project No. R11-0861-100

$2,894,675.00

CONTRACTOR

Vinton Construction Co.

Super Excavators

DF Tomasini, Inc.

Globe Contractors, Inc.

Reesman's Excavating & Grading

P.O. Box 1987 N59 W14601 Bobolink Ave. N70W25176 Indian Grass Ln. N50 W23076 Betker Road 28815 Bushnell Road
Manitowoc, WI. 54221-1987 Menomonee Falls, WI 53217 Sussex, WI 53089 Pewaukee, WI 53072-0450 Burlington, W1 53105
BID SECURITY 5% BB X 5% BB X 5% BB X 5% BB X 5% BB X
ADDENDUM NOs. 1 & 2 X X X X X
No. | Item [unit] oty Price | Total Price | Total Price | Total Price | Total Price | Total
Section D - Roadway Restoration
36 |30" Concrete Curb & Gutter LF 3,640 $14.50 $52,780.00 $18.00 $65,520.00 $16.50 $60,060.00 $15.00 $54,600.00 $20.00 $72,800.00
37 |8" Concrete Pavement SY 5,485 $45.50 $249,567.50 $37.00 $202,945.00 $41.50 $227,627.50 $34.00 $186,490.00 $40.00 $219,400.00
38 |Base Aggregate Dense TONS 1,970 $21.00 $41,370.00 $14.00 $27,580.00 $22.00 $43,340.00 $14.00 $27,580.00 $24.00 $47,280.00
39 |4 1/2" Asphaltic Concrete Pavement TONS 70 $200.00 $14,000.00 $185.00 $12,950.00 $425.00 $29,750.00 $185.00 $12,950.00 $225.00 $15,750.00
40 |5" Concrete Sidewalk SF 4,710 $5.00 $23,550.00 $4.40 $20,724.00 $5.50 $25,905.00 $4.00 $18,840.00 $6.50 $30,615.00
41 |7" Concrete Driveway SY 55 $48.50 $2,667.50 $43.00 $2,365.00 $38.00 $2,090.00 $45.00 $2,475.00 $97.00 $5,335.00
42 |3" Asphaltic Surface Driveways TONS 2 $500.00 $1.000.00 $185.00 $370.00 $500.00 $1.000.00 $200.00 $400.00 $535.00 $1.070.00
43 |Sawcutting LF 6,675 $2.00 $13.350.00 $1.60 $10.680.00 $1.50 $10.012.50 $1.50 $10.012.50 $2.00 $13.350.00
44 |Re-sawcutting LF 2,300 $2.00 $4.600.00 $1.60 $3.680.00 $1.75 $4.025.00 $1.50 $3.450.00 $2.00 $4.600.00
45 |Tree Removal IN. DIA. 500 $40.00 $20.000.00 $42.00 $21.000.00 $51.00 $25.500.00 $45.00 $22.500.00 $40.00 $20.000.00
46 |Trees EA 17 $260.00 $4.420.00 $425.00 $7.225.00 $425.00 $7.225.00 $500.00 $8.500.00 $393.00 $6.681.00
47 |Lawn Restoration SY 3,700 $7.44 $27.528.00 $18.00 $66.600.00 $7.00 $25.900.00 $5.00 $18.500.00 $13.00 $48.100.00
48 |lrrigation System (Manual) LS 1 $72.000.00 $72.000.00 | $80.000.00 $80.000.00 | $71.100.00 $71.100.00 | $60.000.00 $60.000.00 | $66.485.00 $66.485.00
49 |2" Schedule 40 PVC and Rewiring (estimated) EA 5 $1.921.00 $9.605.00 | $1.925.00 $9.625.00 | $2.000.00 $10.000.00 | $2.000.00 $10.000.00 | $1.936.00 $9.680.00
50 |Remove and Relocate Light Pole (estimated) EA 5 $1.100.00 $5.500.00 $955.00 $4.775.00 $1.000.00 $5.000.00 $1.000.00 $5.000.00 $955.00 $4.775.00
51 |6" Pavement Marking Crosswalk LF 2,080 $7.50 $15,600.00 $7.50 $15,600.00 $7.75 $16,120.00 $8.00 $16,640.00 $7.60 $15,808.00
52 |[8" Pavement Marking Channelizing LF 45 $3.50 $157.50 $3.50 $157.50 $3.75 $168.75 $4.00 $180.00 $3.60 $162.00
53 |18" Pavement Marking, Stop Line LF 180 $10.15 $1,827.00 $10.15 $1,827.00 $10.25 $1,845.00 $11.00 $1,980.00 $10.25 $1,845.00
54 [Pavement Marking Arrows EA 1 $315.00 $315.00 $315.00 $315.00 $325.00 $325.00 $350.00 $350.00 $320.00 $320.00
55 |Traffic Control LS 1 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 | $11,400.00 $11,400.00 | $29,100.00 $29,100.00 | $38,000.00 $38,000.00 | $98,370.00 $98,370.00
56 |Detour Route LS 1 $9,115.00 $9,115.00 | $14,600.00 $14,600.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $1,515.00 $1,515.00
57 [Top Dressing Lawn Restoration SY 3,700 $1.47 $5,439.00 $2.90 $10,730.00 $2.00 $7,400.00 $1.50 $5,550.00 $2.25 $8,325.00
Subtotal - Section D, Items 36 thru 57, Inclusive... Subtotal| $724,391.50 | Subtotal| $590,668.50 | Subtotal| $604,993.75 | Subtotal $508,997.50 | Subtotal $692,266.00
TOTAL - (Alternate Bid #2) - ITEMS 1 thru 57, INCLUSIVE... TOTAL | $2,460,443.50 TOTAL | $2,732,546.23 TOTAL| $3,184,970.25 TOTAL $2,490,851.50 TOTAL $2,868,376.00
Alternate Bid Items
No. Item Unit oty Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total
8™ Storm Sewer W/Low pressure head Sanitary Sewer
24A |Pipe LF 584 $185.00 $108,040.00 $348.00 $203,232.00 No Bid $413.00 $241,192.00 $380.00 $221,920.00
54" Storm Sewer w/Low pressure head Sanitary Sewer
25A |Pipe LF 656 $244.00 $160,064.00 $464.00 $304,384.00 No Bid $508.00 $333,248.00 $543.00 $356,208.00
48A |Irrigation System (Automatic) EA 1 $74,000.00 $74,000.00 | $82,600.00 $82,600.00 | $73,600.00 $73,600.00| $65,000.00 $65,000.00( $76,725.00 $76,725.00
Subtotal - Alternate Bid Items 24A, 25A and 48A, Inclusive... Subtotal| $342,104.00 Subtotal| $590,216.00 Subtotal $73,600.00 Subtotal $639,440.00 Subtotal| $654,853.00
TOTAL - Alternate Bid #2 - TTEMS 1 thru 23, 24A-25A, 26 thru 47,
48A, 49 thru 57, INCLUSIVE... TOTAL | $2,475,563.50 TOTAL| $2,786,202.23 TOTAL| $3,187,470.25 TOTAL $2,676,451.50 TOTAL| $3,103,384.00

Addendum Items In Blue
Adjusted Amounts
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&Y Bid Tabulation - Schedule of Supplemental Unit Prices Bid Tabulatio

2roject Name: South Side Storm Water Bid Date: February 13, 2014
Owner: Phase IV/Hampton Road Storm Sewer Time:
Village of Whitefish Bay Project No.
CONTRACTOR Vinton Construction Co. Super Excavators DF Tomasini, Inc. Globe Contractors, Inc. Reesman's Excavating & Grading
P.O. Box 1987 N59 W14601 Bobolink Ave. N70W25176 Indian Grass Ln. N50 W23076 Betker Road 28815 Bushnell Road
Manitowoc, WI. 54221-1987 Menomonee Falls, WI 53217 Sussex, WI 53089 Pewaukee, WI 53072-0450 Burlington, WI 53105
No. | Item [ Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price
Utility Construction - General:
1 [Rock excavation. CY $500.00 $250.00 $300.00 $300.00 $275.00
Close sheathing and bracing, ordered left
2 |in place. 1,000 BF $10,000.00 $4,000.00 $6,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,500.00
Spot sheathing and bracing, ordered left
3 [in place. 1,000 BF $10,000.00 $3,500.00 $6,000.00 $4,000.00 $5,500.00

No. 3 crushed stone, 2 inch size, for
unstable trench bottom, including
4 |excavation of unsuitable material. CY $50.00 $45.00 $40.00 $45.00 $50.00

Granular backfill, ordered to replace
excavated material backfill, including

5 |disposal of excavated material. CY $40.00 $42.00 $30.00 $20.00 $25.00
Excavated material backfill, ordered to

6 [replace granular backfill, deduct. cYy $10.00 $5.00 $10.00 $3.00 $5.00
Slurry backfill, ordered to replace granular

7 |backfill. LF $100.00 $50.00 $60.00 $50.00 $40.00
Granular backfill, to support underground

8 |structures. LF $50.00 $35.00 $30.00 $50.00 $25.00
Reinforced concrete beam, to support

9 |underground structures. EA $500.00 $200.00 $400.00 $250.00 $80.00

10 [Insulation EA $15.00 $20.00 $10.00 $20.00

Road Construction:

Excavation below subgrade of frost-heave
1 |or other unsuitable material. CY $35.00 $38.00 $40.00 $40.00 $20.00
Granular backfill for excavation below

subgrade when suitable material is not

2 |available. CY $25.00 $35.00 $30.00 $20.00 $15.00
Stone backfill to stabilze subgrade, 2 inch
3 |[size. TON $25.00 $35.00 $30.00 $40.00 $18.00
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Gcmspsufswvom, INC.

droject Name: South Side Storm Water

Owner:

Phase 1V/Hampton Road Storm Sewer

Village of Whitefish Bay

Bid Tabulation - Schedule of Supplemental Unit Prices

Bid Date: February 13, 2014

Time:

Project No.

Bid Tabulatio
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CONTRACTOR Vinton Construction Co. Super Excavators DF Tomasini, Inc. Globe Contractors, Inc. Reesman's Excavating & Grading
P.O. Box 1987 N59 W14601 Bobolink Ave. N70W25176 Indian Grass Ln. N50 W23076 Betker Road 28815 Bushnell Road
Manitowoc, WI. 54221-1987 Menomonee Falls, WI 53217 Sussex, WI 53089 Pewaukee, WI 53072-0450 Burlington, WI 53105
No. Item Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price
Soil stabilization fabric, Mirafi 600X or
4 |equal SY $5.00 $6.00 $5.00 $5.00 $12.00
Subbase material, crushed stone -
Gradiation No. 1, placed over stabilization
5 |fabric. TON $30.00 $30.00 $20.00 $40.00 $20.00
6 |[Clearing and Grubbing IN. DIA. $50.00 $25.00 $75.00 $45.00 $55.00
7 [Borrow Excavation cY $25.00 $20.00 $15.00 $15.00 $15.00
8 |Erosion Bales EA $50.00 $15.00 $100.00 $20.00 $15.00
9 |Silt fence; placed and maintained LF $5.00 $4.00 $500.00 $5.00 $3.00
10 [Sod SY 10 8 7 12 $9.00
11 [Erosion Bales SY $4.00 $4.00 $3.00 $3.00 $3.00
Valve box section, to adjust valve boxes
12 |to grade. EA $200.00 $150.00 $125.00 $350.00 $150.00
13 |Align manhole frames disturbed by others. EA $500.00 $500.00 $400.00 $500.00 $300.00
14 |Align valve boxes disturbed by others. EA $300.00 $250.00 $250.00 $250.00 $200.00
Curing paper to provide frost protection
15 [for concrete sidewalk and driveways SY $2.50 $5.00 $1.00 $1.00 $5.00
Straw or hay with curing paper to provide
frost protection for concrete sidewalk and
16 |driveways. SY $7.00 $5.00 $3.00 $3.00 $8.00
Curing paper to provide frost protection
17 [for concrete curb and gutter LF $2.50 $5.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00
Straw or hay WIth curing paper to provide
frost protection for concrete curb and
18 |gutter LF $5.00 $5.00 $2.00 $2.00 $2.00
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